

Diana L. Quast, Town Clerk
dquast@yorktownny.org



Registrar of Vital Statistics
Telephone: (914) 962-5722 x 208
Fax: (914) 962 6591

TOWN OF YORKTOWN
363 Underhill Avenue, P.O. Box 703
Yorktown Heights, NY 10598

This is a resolution adopted by the Town Board of the Town of Yorktown at its regular meeting held on Tuesday, May 1, 2018.

WHEREAS, invitation to bid for **T-Shirt and Uniforms** for use town-wide, was duly advertised, and

WHEREAS said bids were received and opened at 11:00 a.m. on the 30th day of April 2018, now therefore be it,

RESOLVED, that upon the recommendation of the Superintendent of Parks & Recreation, the bid be and is hereby awarded to the lowest bidder, Front Nine Capital, LLC d/b/a Star Sports, for the items numbered PR-1 through LIB-3, as outlined on the attached summary of bids.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, these items will be ordered on a per item basis by Department.



Diana L. Quast, RMC, Town Clerk

Date: May 2, 2018

To: Todd Orłowski, Superintendent of Parks & Recreation

cc: Ilan D. Gilbert, Town Supervisor
Richard Abbate, Town Attorney
Patricia Caporale, Town Comptroller
Front Nine Capital, LLC d/b/a Star Sports
file

ITEM	COMPANY	SIZE	Star		Armadillo		Woods		Riddell		Greek	
ITEM	QTY	SIZE										
PR-1	44	S-XL	\$ 6.02	\$ 264.88	\$ 5.35	\$ 235.40	\$ 5.74	\$ 252.56	\$ 10.35	\$ 455.40	\$ 8.00	\$ 352.00
	4	XXL	\$ 8.33	\$ 33.32	\$ 7.25	\$ 29.00	\$ 7.59	\$ 30.36	\$ 12.35	\$ 49.40	\$ 8.00	\$ 32.00
PR-2	4	M-XL	\$ 6.04	\$ 24.16	\$ 5.75	\$ 23.00	\$ 7.24	\$ 28.96	\$ 14.35	\$ 57.40	\$ 11.00	\$ 44.00
PR-3	242	S-XL	\$ 2.84	\$ 687.28	\$ 3.40	\$ 822.80	\$ 3.88	\$ 938.96	\$ 4.53	\$ 1,096.26	\$ 4.25	\$ 1,028.50
	4	XXL	\$ 4.66	\$ 18.64	\$ 4.75	\$ 19.00	\$ 5.68	\$ 22.72	\$ 6.53	\$ 26.12	\$ 4.25	\$ 17.00
PR-4	132	S-XL	\$ 2.64	\$ 348.48	\$ 3.00	\$ 396.00	\$ 3.24	\$ 427.68	\$ 3.53	\$ 465.96	\$ 2.75	\$ 363.00
	2	XXL	\$ 4.86	\$ 9.72	\$ 4.25	\$ 8.50	\$ 4.94	\$ 9.88	\$ 3.53	\$ 7.06	\$ 2.75	\$ 5.50
	456	YS-YL	\$ 2.62	\$ 1,194.72	\$ 3.00	\$ 1,368.00	\$ 2.98	\$ 1,358.88	\$ 3.53	\$ 1,609.68	\$ 2.75	\$ 1,254.00
	48	YXS	\$ 2.62	\$ 125.76	\$ 3.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 2.98	\$ 143.04	\$ 3.53	\$ 169.44	\$ 2.75	\$ 132.00
PR-5	126	S-XL	\$ 2.84	\$ 357.84	\$ 3.25	\$ 409.50	\$ 4.07	\$ 512.82	\$ 4.53	\$ 570.78	\$ 3.50	\$ 441.00
	6	XXL	\$ 4.86	\$ 29.16	\$ 4.50	\$ 27.00	\$ 5.64	\$ 33.84	\$ 6.53	\$ 39.18	\$ 3.50	\$ 21.00
	24	YS-YL	\$ 2.82	\$ 67.68	\$ 3.25	\$ 78.00	\$ 3.74	\$ 89.76	\$ 4.53	\$ 108.72	\$ 3.50	\$ 84.00
PR-6	12	S-XL	\$ 2.84	\$ 34.08	\$ 3.50	\$ 42.00	\$ 6.35	\$ 76.20	\$ 4.03	\$ 48.36	\$ 6.25	\$ 75.00
	20	YS-YL	\$ 2.84	\$ 56.80	\$ 3.25	\$ 65.00	\$ 6.05	\$ 121.00	\$ 4.03	\$ 80.60	\$ 6.25	\$ 125.00
PR-7	45	S-XL	\$ 2.67	\$ 120.15	\$ 3.25	\$ 146.25	\$ 3.18	\$ 143.10	\$ 4.96	\$ 223.20	\$ 3.25	\$ 146.25
	15	XXL	\$ 4.51	\$ 67.65	\$ 4.40	\$ 66.00	\$ 4.98	\$ 74.70	\$ 6.96	\$ 104.40	\$ 3.25	\$ 48.75
PR-8	60	S-XL	\$ 2.67	\$ 160.20	\$ 3.45	\$ 207.00	\$ 4.34	\$ 260.40	\$ 4.96	\$ 297.60	\$ 2.75	\$ 165.00
	12	XXL	\$ 4.51	\$ 54.12	\$ 4.65	\$ 55.80	\$ 6.24	\$ 74.88	\$ 6.96	\$ 83.52	\$ 2.75	\$ 33.00
PR-9	63	S-XL	\$ 4.88	\$ 307.44	\$ 6.00	\$ 378.00	\$ 6.36	\$ 400.68	\$ 6.76	\$ 425.88	\$ 5.25	\$ 330.75
	4	XXL	\$ 6.16	\$ 24.64	\$ 8.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 7.58	\$ 30.32	\$ 8.76	\$ 35.04	\$ 5.25	\$ 21.00
PR-10	84	S-L	\$ 4.66	\$ 391.44	\$ 5.50	\$ 462.00	\$ 4.74	\$ 398.16	\$ 8.04	\$ 675.36	\$ 5.50	\$ 462.00
PR-11	114	S-XL	\$ 9.56	\$ 1,089.84	\$ 10.50	\$ 1,197.00	\$ 9.78	\$ 1,114.92	\$ 9.58	\$ 1,092.12	\$ 6.50	\$ 741.00
	6	XXL	\$ 10.67	\$ 64.02	\$ 12.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 10.94	\$ 65.64	\$ 11.58	\$ 69.48	\$ 6.50	\$ 39.00
	60	YL	\$ 7.89	\$ 473.40	\$ 10.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 8.58	\$ 514.80	\$ 10.39	\$ 623.40	\$ 6.50	\$ 390.00
PR-12												
PR-13	2	M-XL	\$ 14.25	\$ 28.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 17.24	\$ 34.48	\$ 14.26	\$ 28.52	\$ 10.50	\$ 21.00
	5	XXL	\$ 15.25	\$ 76.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 86.25	\$ 19.84	\$ 99.20	No Bid		\$ 10.50	\$ 52.50
PR-14	6	M-XL	\$ 36.50	\$ 219.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 41.24	\$ 247.44	\$ 56.26	\$ 337.56	\$ 13.75	\$ 82.50
	6	XXL	\$ 38.50	\$ 231.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 288.00	\$ 42.80	\$ 256.80	\$ 58.26	\$ 349.56	\$ 13.75	\$ 82.50
	1	XXXL	\$ 40.50	\$ 40.50	\$ 49.50	\$ 49.50	\$ 46.24	\$ 46.24	\$ 58.26	\$ 58.26	\$ 13.75	\$ 13.75

ITEM	COMPANY	SIZE	Star		Armadillo		Woods		Riddell		Greek	
PR-15	6	M-XL	\$ 49.25	\$ 295.50	\$ 78.00	\$ 468.00	\$ 57.24	\$ 343.44	\$ 83.51	\$ 501.06	\$ 15.25	\$ 91.50
	7	XXL	\$ 50.25	\$ 351.75	\$ 80.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 59.20	\$ 414.40	\$ 85.51	\$ 598.57	\$ 15.25	\$ 106.75
	1	XXXL	\$ 54.24	\$ 54.24	\$ 82.00	\$ 82.00	\$ 63.20	\$ 63.20	\$ 85.51	\$ 85.51	\$ 15.25	\$ 15.25
H-1	115	S-XL	\$ 2.74	\$ 315.10	\$ 3.25	\$ 373.75	\$ 3.14	\$ 361.10	\$ 4.46	\$ 512.90	\$ 2.75	\$ 316.25
	8	XXL	\$ 4.86	\$ 38.88	\$ 4.50	\$ 36.00	\$ 4.98	\$ 39.84	\$ 6.46	\$ 51.68	\$ 2.75	\$ 22.00
	10	XXXL	\$ 6.42	\$ 64.20	\$ 6.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 6.14	\$ 61.40	\$ 6.46	\$ 64.60	\$ 2.75	\$ 27.50
H-2	115	S-XL	\$ 4.20	\$ 483.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 690.00	\$ 5.43	\$ 624.45	\$ 4.46	\$ 512.90	\$ 6.00	\$ 690.00
	9	XXL	\$ 5.82	\$ 52.38	\$ 8.75	\$ 78.75	\$ 6.98	\$ 62.82	\$ 6.46	\$ 58.14	\$ 6.00	\$ 54.00
	10	XXXL	\$ 7.54	\$ 75.40	\$ 10.50	\$ 105.00	\$ 9.18	\$ 91.80	\$ 6.46	\$ 64.60	\$ 6.00	\$ 60.00
H-3	65	M-XL	\$ 26.13	\$ 1,698.45	\$ 28.00	\$ 1,820.00	\$ 31.24	\$ 2,030.60	\$ 27.85	\$ 1,810.25	\$ 15.25	\$ 991.25
	10	XXL	\$ 29.32	\$ 293.20	\$ 29.50	\$ 295.00	\$ 35.98	\$ 359.80	\$ 29.85	\$ 298.50	\$ 15.25	\$ 152.50
	11	XXXL	\$ 29.32	\$ 322.52	\$ 30.50	\$ 335.50	\$ 35.98	\$ 395.78	\$ 29.85	\$ 328.35	\$ 15.25	\$ 167.75
H-4	45	L-XL	\$ 33.50	\$ 1,507.50	\$ 45.00	\$ 2,025.00	\$ 38.74	\$ 1,743.30	\$ 55.26	\$ 2,486.70	\$ 18.25	\$ 821.25
	12	XXL	\$ 36.94	\$ 443.28	\$ 48.00	\$ 576.00	\$ 39.90	\$ 478.80	\$ 57.26	\$ 687.12	\$ 18.25	\$ 219.00
	13	XXXL	\$ 36.91	\$ 479.83	\$ 49.50	\$ 643.50	\$ 43.90	\$ 570.70	\$ 57.26	\$ 744.38	\$ 18.25	\$ 237.25
RR-1	14	S-XL	\$ 2.74	\$ 38.36	\$ 5.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 3.97	\$ 55.58	\$ 4.96	\$ 69.44	\$ 5.75	\$ 80.50
	15	XXL	\$ 4.86	\$ 72.90	\$ 6.50	\$ 97.50	\$ 5.87	\$ 88.05	\$ 6.96	\$ 104.40	\$ 5.75	\$ 86.25
	16	XXL Tall	\$ 6.42	\$ 102.72	\$ 9.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 7.67	\$ 122.72	\$ 6.96	\$ 111.36	\$ 5.75	\$ 92.00
RR-2	5	S-XL	\$ 4.20	\$ 21.00	\$ 7.10	\$ 35.50	\$ 5.87	\$ 29.35	\$ 7.51	\$ 37.55	\$ 7.25	\$ 36.25
	10	XXL	\$ 5.82	\$ 58.20	\$ 9.75	\$ 97.50	\$ 7.37	\$ 73.70	\$ 9.51	\$ 95.10	\$ 7.25	\$ 72.50
	5	XXL Tall	\$ 7.54	\$ 37.70	\$ 10.15	\$ 50.75	\$ 11.24	\$ 56.20	\$ 9.51	\$ 47.55	\$ 7.25	\$ 36.25
RR-3	30	S-XL	\$ 2.84	\$ 85.20	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 3.74	\$ 112.20	\$ 4.03	\$ 120.90	No Bid	
	15	XXL	\$ 4.86	\$ 72.90	\$ 4.50	\$ 67.50	\$ 5.58	\$ 83.70	\$ 6.03	\$ 90.45	No Bid	
	1	XXXL	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.58	\$ 6.58	\$ 6.03	\$ 6.03	No Bid	
RR-4	30	S-XL	\$ 5.36	\$ 160.80	\$ 7.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 5.76	\$ 172.80	\$ 7.95	\$ 238.50	No Bid	
	15	XXL	\$ 6.36	\$ 95.40	\$ 9.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 6.72	\$ 100.80	\$ 9.95	\$ 149.25	No Bid	
	1	XXXL	\$ 7.47	\$ 7.47	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.92	\$ 8.92	\$ 9.95	\$ 9.95	No Bid	
BM-1	23	S-XL	\$ 2.84	\$ 65.32	\$ 5.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 91.54	\$ 4.78	\$ 109.94	\$ 5.00	\$ 115.00
	1	XXL	\$ 4.86	\$ 4.86	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 5.48	\$ 5.48	\$ 6.78	\$ 6.78	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00
BM-2	23	S-XL	\$ 4.78	\$ 109.94	\$ 7.00	\$ 161.00	\$ 5.98	\$ 137.54	\$ 7.51	\$ 172.73	\$ 5.00	\$ 115.00
	1	XXL	\$ 6.16	\$ 6.16	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 7.44	\$ 7.44	\$ 9.51	\$ 9.51	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00

	COMPANY		Star		Armadillo		Woods		Riddell		Greek	
ITEM	QTY	SIZE										
BM-3	24	S-XL	\$ 11.85	\$ 284.40	\$ 15.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 15.24	\$ 365.76	No Bid		\$ 8.00	\$ 192.00
	1	XXL	\$ 13.10	\$ 13.10	\$ 16.25	\$ 16.25	\$ 16.44	\$ 16.44	No Bid		\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
BM-4	4	L-XL	\$ 33.50	\$ 134.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 184.00	\$ 40.74	\$ 162.96	\$ 56.26	\$ 225.04	\$ 22.50	\$ 90.00
	1	XXL	\$ 36.91	\$ 36.91	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 41.74	\$ 41.74	\$ 58.26	\$ 58.26	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
B-1	1	S-XL	\$ 11.85	\$ 11.85	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 16.74	\$ 16.74	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
	1	XXL	\$ 13.10	\$ 13.10	\$ 16.25	\$ 16.25	\$ 17.98	\$ 17.98	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
B-2	1	S-XL	\$ 4.80	\$ 4.80	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50	\$ 9.28	\$ 9.28	\$ 11.32	\$ 11.32	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
	1	XXL	\$ 6.16	\$ 6.16	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.68	\$ 10.68	\$ 13.32	\$ 13.32	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
B-3	1	S-XL	\$ 5.69	\$ 5.69	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 7.24	\$ 7.24	No Bid		\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00
	1	XXL	\$ 7.69	\$ 7.69	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 9.24	\$ 9.24	No Bid		\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00
PL-1	2	M-XL	\$ 31.85	\$ 63.70	\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 34.90	\$ 69.80	No Bid		No Bid	
	2	M-L(w)	\$ 34.12	\$ 68.24	\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 34.90	\$ 69.80	No Bid		No Bid	
PL-2	2	L-XL	\$ 11.85	\$ 23.70	\$ 15.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 16.98	\$ 33.96	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 24.00
PL-3	2	M-XL	\$ 20.75	\$ 41.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 27.24	\$ 54.48	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 24.00
PL-4	2	M-XL	\$ 9.25	\$ 18.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.24	\$ 20.48	\$ 14.35	\$ 28.70	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00
PL-5	2	M-XL	\$ 29.85	\$ 59.70	\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 37.44	\$ 74.88	No Bid		\$ 19.50	\$ 39.00
PL-6	4	XS-XL	\$ 26.24	\$ 104.96	\$ 30.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 34.54	\$ 138.16	\$ 40.49	\$ 161.96	\$ 18.00	\$ 72.00
S-1	1	M-XL	\$ 11.85	\$ 11.85	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 16.78	\$ 16.78	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
	1	XXL	\$ 13.10	\$ 13.10	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 17.98	\$ 17.98	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
	1	XXXL	\$ 15.10	\$ 15.10	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 19.24	\$ 19.24	No Bid		\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
S-2	10	S-XL	\$ 2.57	\$ 25.70	\$ 6.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 4.34	\$ 43.40	\$ 5.71	\$ 57.10	\$ 4.75	\$ 47.50
	1	XXL	\$ 4.51	\$ 4.51	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 6.24	\$ 6.24	\$ 7.71	\$ 7.71	\$ 4.75	\$ 4.75
	1	XXXL	\$ 5.80	\$ 5.80	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 7.44	\$ 7.44	\$ 7.71	\$ 7.71	\$ 4.75	\$ 4.75
S-3	6	M-XL	\$ 4.78	\$ 28.68	\$ 8.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 5.88	\$ 35.28	\$ 7.51	\$ 45.06	\$ 6.25	\$ 37.50
	1	XXL	\$ 6.16	\$ 6.16	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 7.44	\$ 7.44	\$ 9.51	\$ 9.51	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.25
	1	XXXL	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.95	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 9.68	\$ 9.68	\$ 9.51	\$ 9.51	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.25
S-4	1	M-XL	\$ 26.13	\$ 26.13	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 34.20	\$ 34.20	No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
	1	XXL	\$ 29.32	\$ 29.32	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 37.94	\$ 37.94	No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
	1	XXXL	\$ 29.32	\$ 29.32	\$ 30.50	\$ 30.50	\$ 37.94	\$ 37.94	No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
	1	XXXXL	\$ 31.32	\$ 31.32	\$ 32.50	\$ 32.50	\$ 37.94	\$ 37.94	No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00

	COMPANY		Star		Armadillo		Woods		Riddell		Greek	
ITEM	QTY	SIZE										
S-5	6	M-XL	\$ 33.50	\$ 201.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 41.34	\$ 248.04	\$ 56.26	\$ 337.56	\$ 19.75	\$ 118.50
	4	XXL	\$ 36.91	\$ 147.64	\$ 48.00	\$ 192.00	\$ 42.34	\$ 169.36	\$ 58.26	\$ 233.04	\$ 19.75	\$ 79.00
	1	XXXL	\$ 38.50	\$ 38.50	\$ 49.50	\$ 49.50	\$ 46.34	\$ 46.34	\$ 58.26	\$ 58.26	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75
	1	XXXXL	\$ 42.50	\$ 42.50	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 46.34	\$ 46.34	58.26	\$ 58.26	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75
W-1	2	S-XL	\$ 12.92	\$ 25.84	\$ 16.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 16.98	\$ 33.96	No Bid		\$ 9.25	\$ 18.50
	9	XXL	\$ 15.32	\$ 137.88	\$ 18.00	\$ 162.00	\$ 19.24	\$ 173.16	No Bid		\$ 9.25	\$ 83.25
W-2	65	S-XL	\$ 2.57	\$ 167.05	\$ 6.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 3.08	\$ 200.20	\$ 4.71	\$ 306.15	No Bid	
	20	XXL	\$ 4.51	\$ 90.20	\$ 8.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 4.88	\$ 97.60	\$ 6.71	\$ 134.20	No Bid	
	5	XXL	\$ 5.80	\$ 29.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 5.98	\$ 29.90	\$ 6.71	\$ 33.55	No Bid	
W-3	50	S-XL	\$ 4.78	\$ 239.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 5.68	\$ 284.00	\$ 6.51	\$ 325.50	\$ 4.75	\$ 237.50
	15	XXL	\$ 6.16	\$ 92.40	\$ 10.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 7.28	\$ 109.20	\$ 8.51	\$ 127.65	\$ 4.75	\$ 71.25
	5	XXXL	\$ 7.99	\$ 39.93	\$ 11.50	\$ 57.50	\$ 9.48	\$ 47.40	\$ 8.51	\$ 42.55	\$ 4.75	\$ 23.75
W-4	6	M-XL	\$ 10.69	\$ 64.14	\$ 12.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 11.24	\$ 67.44	No Bid		No Bid	
	2	XXL	\$ 11.90	\$ 23.80	\$ 13.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 11.24	\$ 22.48	No Bid		No Bid	
W-5	20	S-XL	\$ 33.50	\$ 670.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 38.44	\$ 768.80	\$ 55.51	\$ 1,110.20	\$ 18.50	\$ 370.00
	8	XXL	\$ 36.91	\$ 295.28	\$ 48.00	\$ 384.00	\$ 39.88	\$ 319.04	\$ 57.51	\$ 460.08	\$ 18.50	\$ 148.00
	4	XXXL	\$ 38.91	\$ 155.64	\$ 49.00	\$ 196.00	\$ 43.84	\$ 175.36	\$ 57.51	\$ 230.04	\$ 18.50	\$ 74.00
W-6	8	S-XL	\$ 95.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 48.44	\$ 387.52	No Bid		No Bid	
	3	XXL	\$ 95.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 49.94	\$ 149.82	No Bid		No Bid	
W-7	6	S-XL	\$ 26.13	\$ 156.78	\$ 28.00	\$ 168.00	\$ 33.74	\$ 202.44	No Bid		\$ 17.25	\$ 103.50
	6	XXL	\$ 29.32	\$ 175.92	\$ 29.50	\$ 177.00	\$ 37.24	\$ 223.44	No Bid		\$ 17.25	\$ 103.50
NUT-1	17	S-XL	\$ 49.25	\$ 837.25	\$ 78.00	\$ 1,326.00	\$ 58.04	\$ 986.68	\$ 83.51	\$ 1,419.67	\$ 15.25	\$ 259.25
	1	XXL	\$ 54.24	\$ 54.24	\$ 80.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 58.90	\$ 58.90	\$ 85.51	\$ 85.51	\$ 15.25	\$ 15.25
NUT-2	7	S-XL	\$ 25.39	\$ 177.73	\$ 25.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 29.24	\$ 204.68	No Bid		No Bid	
LIB-1	5	LG	\$ 4.25	\$ 21.25	\$ 6.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 3.68	\$ 18.40	\$ 5.71	\$ 28.55	\$ 7.50	\$ 37.50
LIB-2	5	LG	\$ 4.25	\$ 21.25	\$ 8.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 5.94	\$ 29.70	\$ 7.51	\$ 37.55	\$ 9.00	\$ 45.00
LIB-3	1	LG	\$ 33.50	\$ 33.50	\$ 47.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 39.90	\$ 39.90	\$ 56.26	\$ 56.26	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
TOTAL SUM				\$ 20,136.99		\$ 24,544.50		\$ 23,173.67		\$ 25,092.74		\$ 13,847.25

COMPANY			TRUE		Fun Exp		ABC	
ITEM	QTY	SIZE						
PR-1	44	S-XL	\$ 4.80	\$ 211.20	\$ 6.31	\$ 277.64	\$ 4.90	\$ 215.60
	4	XXL	\$ 4.80	\$ 19.20	\$ 6.31	\$ 25.24	\$ 6.80	\$ 27.20
PR-2	4	M-XL	\$ 4.29	\$ 17.16	\$ 9.65	\$ 38.60	\$ 4.90	\$ 19.60
PR-3	242	S-XL	\$ 2.45	\$ 592.90	\$ 6.14	\$ 1,485.88	\$ 3.65	\$ 883.30
	4	XXL	\$ 2.45	\$ 9.80	\$ 6.14	\$ 24.56	\$ 5.30	\$ 21.20
PR-4	132	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 290.40	\$ 3.15	\$ 415.80	\$ 2.48	\$ 327.36
	2	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 4.40	\$ 3.15	\$ 6.30	\$ 4.18	\$ 8.36
	456	YS-YL	\$ 2.20	\$ 1,003.20	\$ 3.62	\$ 1,650.72	\$ 2.73	\$ 1,244.88
	48	YXS	\$ 2.20	\$ 105.60	\$ 3.62	\$ 173.76	\$ 2.73	\$ 131.04
PR-5	126	S-XL	\$ 2.45	\$ 308.70	\$ 3.84	\$ 483.84	\$ 3.75	\$ 472.50
	6	XXL	\$ 2.45	\$ 14.70	\$ 3.84	\$ 23.04	\$ 5.40	\$ 32.40
	24	YS-YL	\$ 2.45	\$ 58.80	\$ 4.24	\$ 101.76	\$ 3.85	\$ 92.40
PR-6	12	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 26.40	\$ 3.97	\$ 47.64	\$ 5.35	\$ 64.20
	20	YS-YL	\$ 2.20	\$ 44.00	\$ 4.47	\$ 89.40	\$ 5.35	\$ 107.00
PR-7	45	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 99.00	\$ 3.78	\$ 170.10	\$ 3.45	\$ 155.25
	15	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 33.00	\$ 4.78	\$ 71.70	\$ 5.10	\$ 76.50
PR-8	60	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 132.00	\$ 3.47	\$ 208.20	\$ 3.75	\$ 225.00
	12	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 26.40	\$ 4.47	\$ 53.64	\$ 5.45	\$ 65.40
PR-9	63	S-XL	\$ 2.45	\$ 154.35	\$ 6.82	\$ 429.66	\$ 5.80	\$ 365.40
	4	XXL	\$ 2.45	\$ 9.80	\$ 6.82	\$ 27.28	\$ 7.50	\$ 30.00
PR-10	84	S-L	\$ 3.15	\$ 264.60	\$ 6.91	\$ 580.44	\$ 5.90	\$ 495.60
PR-11	114	S-XL	\$ 4.90	\$ 558.60	\$ 8.25	\$ 940.50	\$ 8.00	\$ 912.00
	6	XXL	\$ 4.90	\$ 29.40	\$ 8.25	\$ 49.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 54.00
	60	YL	\$ 4.90	\$ 294.00	\$ 9.41	\$ 564.60	\$ 6.50	\$ 390.00
PR-12								
PR-13	2	M-XL	No Bid		\$ 16.52	\$ 33.04	\$ 17.00	\$ 34.00
	5	XXL	No Bid		\$ 17.52	\$ 87.60	\$ 19.00	\$ 95.00
PR-14	6	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	6	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	1	XXXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PR-15	6	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	7	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	1	XXXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
H-1	115	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 253.00	\$ 3.74	\$ 430.10	\$ 2.80	\$ 322.00
	8	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 17.60	\$ 3.74	\$ 29.92	\$ 4.40	\$ 35.20
	10	XXXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 22.00	\$ 3.74	\$ 37.40	\$ 4.75	\$ 47.50
H-2	115	S-XL	\$ 3.95	\$ 454.25	\$ 6.94	\$ 798.10	\$ 5.00	\$ 575.00
	9	XXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 35.55	\$ 6.94	\$ 62.46	\$ 6.35	\$ 57.15
	10	XXXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 39.50	\$ 6.94	\$ 69.40	\$ 7.65	\$ 76.50
H-3	65	M-XL	\$ 23.00	\$ 1,495.00	\$ 35.18	\$ 2,286.70	\$ 26.50	\$ 1,722.50
	10	XXL	\$ 23.00	\$ 230.00	\$ 35.18	\$ 351.80	\$ 29.00	\$ 290.00
	11	XXXL	\$ 23.00	\$ 253.00	\$ 35.18	\$ 386.98	\$ 29.50	\$ 324.50

COMPANY			TRUE		Fun Exp		ABC	
ITEM	QTY	SIZE						
H-4	45	L-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	12	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	13	XXXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
RR-1	14	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 30.80	\$ 4.87	\$ 68.18	\$ 5.65	\$ 79.10
	15	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 33.00	\$ 5.87	\$ 88.05	\$ 7.25	\$ 108.75
	16	XXL Tall	\$ 4.90	\$ 78.40	\$ 7.51	\$ 120.16	\$ 9.50	\$ 152.00
RR-2	5	S-XL	\$ 3.95	\$ 19.75	\$ 6.35	\$ 31.75	\$ 5.65	\$ 28.25
	10	XXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 39.50	\$ 8.35	\$ 83.50	\$ 7.25	\$ 72.50
	5	XXL Tall	No Bid		\$ 8.35	\$ 41.75	\$ 9.50	\$ 47.50
RR-3	30	S-XL	No Bid		\$ 4.12	\$ 123.60	\$ 3.75	\$ 112.50
	15	XXL	No Bid		\$ 5.12	\$ 76.80	\$ 5.40	\$ 81.00
	1	XXXL	No Bid		\$ 5.12	\$ 5.12	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
RR-4	30	S-XL	No Bid		\$ 6.97	\$ 209.10	\$ 5.65	\$ 169.50
	15	XXL	No Bid		\$ 7.97	\$ 119.55	\$ 6.95	\$ 104.25
	1	XXXL	No Bid		\$ 7.97	\$ 7.97	\$ 8.30	\$ 8.30
BM-1	23	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 50.60	\$ 3.55	\$ 81.65	\$ 3.60	\$ 82.80
	1	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 2.20	\$ 3.55	\$ 3.55	\$ 4.90	\$ 4.90
BM-2	23	S-XL	\$ 3.95	\$ 90.85	\$ 6.50	\$ 149.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 138.00
	1	XXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 3.95	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.50	\$ 7.40	\$ 7.40
BM-3	24	S-XL	\$ 10.30	\$ 247.20	\$ 15.07	\$ 361.68	\$ 12.00	\$ 288.00
	1	XXL	\$ 10.30	\$ 10.30	\$ 15.07	\$ 15.07	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
BM-4	4	L-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	1	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
B-1	1	S-XL	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
	1	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
B-2	1	S-XL	\$ 3.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 7.01	\$ 7.01	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00
	1	XXL	\$ 3.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 8.01	\$ 8.01	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50
B-3	1	S-XL	\$ 3.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 7.98	\$ 7.98	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
	1	XXL	\$ 3.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 8.98	\$ 8.98	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50
PL-1	2	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	2	M-L(w)	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PL-2	2	L-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PL-3	2	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PL-4	2	M-XL	\$ 4.90	\$ 9.80	\$ 9.22	\$ 18.44	No Bid	
PL-5	2	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PL-6	4	XS-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
S-1	1	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
	1	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
	1	XXXL	NB		No Bid		\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00
S-2	10	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 22.00	\$ 3.65	\$ 36.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 45.00
	1	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 2.20	\$ 4.65	\$ 4.65	\$ 5.80	\$ 5.80
	1	XXXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 2.20	\$ 4.65	\$ 4.65	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00

COMPANY			TRUE		Fun Exp		abc	
ITEM	QTY	SIZE						
S-3	6	M-XL	\$ 3.95	\$ 23.70	\$ 7.21	\$ 43.26	\$ 6.60	\$ 39.60
	1	XXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 3.95	\$ 8.21	\$ 8.21	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
	1	XXXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 3.95	\$ 8.21	\$ 8.21	\$ 9.10	\$ 9.10
S-4	1	M-XL	No Bid		\$ 36.42	\$ 36.42	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
	1	XXL	No Bid		\$ 37.42	\$ 37.42	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00
	1	XXXL	No Bid		\$ 37.42	\$ 37.42	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00
	1	XXXXL	No Bid		\$ 38.42	\$ 38.42	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00
S-5	6	M-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	4	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	1	XXXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	1	XXXXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
W-1	2	S-XL	\$ 11.45	\$ 22.90	\$ 22.62	\$ 45.24	\$ 13.50	\$ 27.00
	9	XXL	\$ 11.45	\$ 103.05	\$ 23.62	\$ 212.58	\$ 14.50	\$ 130.50
W-2	65	S-XL	\$ 2.20	\$ 143.00	\$ 3.95	\$ 256.75	\$ 3.10	\$ 201.50
	20	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 44.00	\$ 4.95	\$ 99.00	\$ 4.90	\$ 98.00
	5	XXL	\$ 2.20	\$ 11.00	\$ 4.95	\$ 24.75	\$ 6.00	\$ 30.00
W-3	50	S-XL	\$ 3.95	\$ 197.50	\$ 7.21	\$ 360.50	\$ 5.40	\$ 270.00
	15	XXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 59.25	\$ 8.21	\$ 123.15	\$ 6.90	\$ 103.50
	5	XXXL	\$ 3.95	\$ 19.75	\$ 8.21	\$ 41.05	\$ 7.90	\$ 39.50
W-4	6	M-XL	No Bid		\$ 13.20	\$ 79.20	No Bid	
	2	XXL	No Bid		\$ 14.20	\$ 28.40	No Bid	
W-5	20	S-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	8	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	4	XXXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
W-6	8	S-XL	No Bid		\$ 43.44	\$ 347.52	No Bid	
	3	XXL	No Bid		\$ 44.44	\$ 133.32	No Bid	
W-7	6	S-XL	No Bid		\$ 35.38	\$ 212.28	\$ 35.00	\$ 210.00
	6	XXL	No Bid		\$ 36.38	\$ 218.28	\$ 38.00	\$ 228.00
NUT-1	17	S-XL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	1	XXL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
NUT-2	7	S-XL	No Bid		\$ 27.07	\$ 189.49	\$ 29.00	\$ 203.00
LIB-1	5	LG	\$ 2.20	\$ 11.00	\$ 13.12	\$ 65.60	\$ 4.80	\$ 24.00
LIB-2	5	LG	\$ 3.95	\$ 19.75	\$ 6.14	\$ 30.70	\$ 7.00	\$ 35.00
LIB-3	1	LG	No Bid		\$ 15.73	\$ 15.73	No Bid	
TOTAL SUM				\$ 8,427.06		\$ 16,895.90		\$ 13,523.54

2018 T-Shirt Bid Results

			NBs
1	TRUE	\$ 8,427.06	YES
2	ABC	\$ 13,523.54	YES
3	Greek	\$ 13,847.25	YES
4	Fun Exp	\$ 16,895.90	YES
5	Star	\$ 20,136.99	NO
6	Woods	\$ 23,173.67	NO
7	Armadillo	\$ 24,544.50	NO

NBs = Has items they did not bid on