

**Diana L. Quast, Town Clerk**  
dquast@yorktownny.org



**Registrar of Vital Statistics**  
Telephone: (914) 962-5722 x 208  
Fax: (914) 962 6591

**TOWN OF YORKTOWN**  
363 Underhill Avenue, P.O. Box 703  
Yorktown Heights, NY 10598

This is a resolution adopted by the Town Board of the Town of Yorktown at its regular meeting held on Tuesday, July 28, 2020.

WHEREAS, invitation to bid for the Asphaltic Concrete Laid-in-Place and Milling for the Town of Yorktown was duly advertised, and

WHEREAS, said bids were received and opened on July 7, 2020, with the bid amounts for the above-referenced project summarized in the attachment, now

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that upon the recommendation of the Highway Superintendent, Dave Paganelli, the bid for the Asphaltic Laid-in-Place Section be and is hereby awarded to Kect Construction Corporation, PO Box 201, Patterson, New York 12563, now

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that upon the recommendation of the Highway Superintendent, Dave Paganelli, the bid for the Asphaltic Laid-in-Place "MILLING" Section of the bid be and is hereby awarded to Intercounty Paving Company, Inc. PO Box 360, Carmel, New York 10512, now

BE IT FURTHER, FURTHER RESOLVED, the contract is to begin on August 1, 2020 and terminates on July 31, 2021. The Town shall have the option to extend this contract at the same price for (3) consecutive times, for a total of four (4) years through July 31, 2024.

\_\_\_\_\_  
Diana L. Quast, Town Clerk  
Town of Yorktown  
Certified Municipal Clerk

Date: July 29, 2020

To: Donald A. Flood, President, Kect Construction Corporation  
Patricia Spano, President, Intercounty Paving Company, Inc.

cc: Matthew J. Slater, Town Supervisor  
Adam Rodriguez, Town Attorney  
David Paganelli, Highway Superintendent  
file

BID RESULTS  
ASPHALT LAID-IN-PLACE

VENDOR	KECT	MONTESANO PCI	INTERCOUNTY ELQ	CLOVE	PALEEN
<b>ASPHALT CONCRETE</b>					
Tack Coat - delivered	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tack Coat - w/o delivery	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>ASPHALT CONCRETE LAID IN PLACE</b>					
<b>1. TYPE 3 BINDER COURSE</b>					
1.a. in place	\$97.20	\$117.00	\$100.29	\$138.45	\$99.00
1.b. in place with keys	\$99.20	\$121.00	\$101.29	\$142.54	\$102.00
1.c. in place with tack coat	\$99.20	\$122.00	\$102.15	\$142.92	\$102.50
1.d. in place with tack coat & keys	\$101.20	\$125.00	\$103.15	\$147.00	\$105.00
<b>2. TYPE 6F3 TOP COURSE</b>					
2.a. in place	\$97.20	\$114.99	\$102.20	\$134.95	\$99.70
2.b. in place with keys	\$99.20	\$119.50	\$103.20	\$138.57	\$102.70
2.c. in place with tack coat	\$99.20	\$119.25	\$104.00	\$139.15	\$103.70
2.d. in place with tack coat & keys	\$101.20	\$123.20	\$104.40	\$142.80	\$105.70
<b>3. TYPE 7F3 TOP COURSE</b>					
3.a. in place	\$106.20	\$6.60	\$109.29	\$142.82	\$108.00
3.b. in place with keys	\$108.20	\$4.96	\$110.29	\$146.45	\$111.00
3.c. in place with tack coat	\$108.20	\$4.83	\$111.15	\$147.00	\$111.00
3.d. in place with tack coat & keys	\$109.20	\$4.83	\$112.15	\$150.70	\$114.00
<b>4. TYPE 1 BASE</b>					
4.a. in place	\$97.20	\$117.00	\$99.29	\$142.75	\$99.00
4.b. in place with keys	\$99.20	\$121.00	\$100.29	\$147.85	\$102.00
4.c. in place with tack coat	\$99.20	\$122.00	\$101.15	\$147.80	\$102.00
4.d. in place with tack coat & keys	\$101.20	\$125.00	\$102.15	\$152.90	\$105.00
<b>MILLING</b>					
0-5000 square yards	\$6.90	\$6.60	\$3.20	\$4.48	\$4.80
5001-10000 square yards	\$4.10	\$4.96	\$3.20	\$4.33	\$4.60
10000-15000 square yards	\$3.25	\$4.83	\$3.00	\$3.40	\$4.50
15001 plus square yards	\$3.10	\$4.83	\$3.00	\$3.40	\$4.00
Trucking (per day per 8 hour day)	\$1,275.00	\$1,550.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,013.00	\$1,440.00
Disposal (square yards)	\$13.75	\$1.58	\$5.00	\$2.22	\$18.00
		\$2.00			\$2.00