2021 T-Shirts and Uniforms Bid Results

COMPANY SP Manufacturing Great Armadillo NYS Indus for Dis IPI, Inc. G&G Int'l Express Ink E Customs
ITEM Qry SIZE

PR-1 44 S-XL S 574 |S 25256 |S 6.10|S 268.40 | S 9.18 | S 40392 |S 660|S 29040 (S$11.70|S 51480|S$ 6.30|S 27720 | S 824 |S  362.56
4 XXL S 7.24|S 2896 | S 8.55(S 34.20 | S 11.79 | S 47.16 | S 9.00 | S 36.00 | $14.50 | S 58.00 S 830 (S 33.20 | $ 1065 (S 42.60
PR-2 6 M-XL S 7.23|S 4338 |S 6.90|S 4140 | S 11.28|S 67.68 S 7.30|S 43.80 | $17.05|S 10230 |S$ 7.44|S 4464 |S 9.52|S 57.12
PR-3 242 S-XL S 292 (S 706.64 | S 3.78 | S 914.76 | S 6.00 (S 1,452.00|S 4.00|S 968.00(S 6.45|S 1,560.90 |S 4.24|S 1,026.08 | S 4.99|S$S 1,207.58
4 XXL S 456 |S 1824 |S 6.10 (S 24.40 | S 8.56 | S 3424 | S 6.25|S 25.00 [ $ 9.20|S 36.80 [ S 6.24|S 2496 | S 7.25|S 29.00
PR-4 130 S-XL S 292 (S 37960 [ S 290 |S 377.00 | $ 550 | $ 71500 (S 360|S 468.00|S 390|S 507.00(S$S 336|S 436.80 | S 3.75|S 487.50
2 XXL S 456 |S 9.12 |$ 5.00 (S 10.00 | $ 8.06 | S 16.12 |S 6.00 | S 12.00|S 6.75 S 1350 | S 536 |S 10.72|$S 525(S 10.50
456 YS-YL S 296 (S 1,349.76 |S 2.75|S 1,254.00 | S 550 (S 2,508.00|S 4.00|S$S 182400 (S 395|S 1,801.20|S 3.36|S 1,532.16 | S 3.85|S$S 1,755.60
48 YXS S 296 |S 14208 |$ 2.75|S 132.00 | $ 5.50 | $ 264.00 | S 4.00|S 19200 (S 395|S 189.60|S 3.36 (S 16128 [S 3.85 (S 184.80
PR-5 126 S-XL S 364 (S 45864 | S 3.60|S 453.60 | S 6.00 [ S 756.00 (S 4.00|S 504.00|S 6.15|S 77490 (S 4.24|S 53424 | S 429 |S 540.54
6 XXL S 573|S 3438 S 575|S 3450 | $ 8.56 | S 5136 | S 6.25|S 37.50 [ $ 9.00|S 54.00 [ $ 6.24|S 3744 | S 6.49|S 38.94
24 YXS-YL S 3.68|S 8832 |S 335|S 80.40 | S 6.00 [ S 144.00 | S 4.00 | S 96.00 |S 6.20 (S 14880 (S 4.24|S 101.76 | S 4.29|S 102.96
PR-6 12 S-XL S 3405 40.80 | S 4.00|S 48.00 | S 5.50 | $ 66.00 [ S 3.60|S 4320 (S 850|S 102.00|S$ 3.36|S 4032 |S 499 |S 59.88

YXS S 3.43(S - S 3.28(S - S 550 | $ - S 360(S - S 850 |5S - S 336|S - S 499 (S -
20 YS-YL S 3.43|5S 68.60 | S 3.28|S 65.60 | S 5.50 | S 11000 [$ 3.60 (S 7200 S 850|S 170.00|S 336 (S 67.20 [ S 4.99|S 99.80
PR-7 45 S-XL S 331(S 14895 | S 3.18|S 143.10 | S 6.00 [ S 270.00 [$ 3.60|S 162.00|S 7.10|S 31950 (S 336|S 151.20 | S 4.15|S 186.75
15 XXL S 5.43|S 8145 (S 5.50|S 82.50 | $ 8.48 | S 12720 (S 7.00|S 105.00|S$10.30|S 15450 (S 536|S 8040 (S 6.49|S 97.35
PR-8 70 S-XL S 331(S 231.70 [ S 3.45|S 24150 | S 6.00 [ S 42000 (S 400|S 280.00|S 965(S 67550 (S 3.36|S 23520 (S 469 |S 328.30
14 XXL S 5.43|S 76.02 | S 575|S 80.50 | $ 8.48 | S 11872 |$ 6.30 (S 88.20 [ $1195|S 16730 |S$ 536|S 75.04 (S 7.19|S 100.66
PR-9 62 S-XL S 6.60(S 409.20 | S 6.00 | S 372.00 | $ 1133 | S 70246 (S 550|S 341.00|S$10.15|S 62930(S 695|S 43090 [ S 499 |S 309.38
4 XXL S 824 |5S 329 |S 7.75|S 31.00 (S 13.79|S 55.16 | S 7.50 | S 30.00 | $12.85|S 5140 (S 895|5S 3580 (S 7.49|S 29.96
PR-10 108 M-XL S 466 (S 503.28 [ S 5.00 | S 540.00 | $ 9.06 | S 97848 |S 5.00|S 540.00|$10.40 (S 1,12320(S 7.13|S 770.04 | S 599 |S 646.92
PR-11 114 S-XL S 6.29|S 717.06 | S 11.25|S 1,28250|S 1234 |S 1,406.76 | S 11.25|S 1,282.50 | $11.60 S 1,32240(|S$S 7.25|S 826.50 |S 9.39|S$ 1,070.46
6 XXL S 829 (S 49.74 | S 11.25|S 67.50 | S 1461 | S 87.66 | S 13.50 | S 81.00 | $14.65|S 8790 |S 9.25|S 55.50 | $ 11.89 | S 71.34
60 YS-YL S 6.29|S 37740 | S 10.25|S 615.00|S 1234 |S 740.40 | S 1150 |S 690.00 | $1160|S 696.00|S 7.25(S 43500 |S 9.39|S$S 563.40

PR-12

PR-13 6 M-XL (Men) |$ 8.20 | S 49.20 | S 11.25|5S 67.50 [ S 20.61 S 123.66 | $ 15.00 | S 90.00 | $21.20|$S 127.20|$12.51 (S 75.06 | S 17.41|S 104.46

0 M-XL (Ladies) | S 8.20 | S - S 13.00 | $ - S 20.61 | S - S 18.00 | S - $21.20|S - $1251|5S - S 1741 (S -
5 XXL (Ladies) | S 9.20 | S 46.00 | S 14.75|S 73.75 | S 22.09 | S 11045 | $ 18.00 | S 90.00 | $2295|S 11475 |$1451|S 7255 [ S 1941 |S 97.05
PR-14 6 M-XL $43.01 S 258.06 | S 38.00 | S 228.00 (S 46.18 | S 277.08 | S 39.00 S 234.00|S$57.70|S 346.20 | $4168|S 250.08 | S 4899 | S 293.94
6 XXL $43.01|S 258.06 | S 38.00|S 228.00|S 46.18|S 277.08 | S 39.00|S 23400 |$61.75|S 370.50 | $43.68 |S 262.08 | S 4899 | S 293.94
1 XXXL $46.81 | S 46.81 | S 40.00 S 4956 (S 49.56 | S 45.00 | S 45.00 | $61.75 | S 61.75 | S 44.68 | S 4468 | S 5299 | S 52.99
PR-15 8 M-XL $54.14 | S 433.12 | S 50.00 |S 400.00|S 57.56|S 460.48 | S 50.00 [ S 400.00 | $65.20 | S 521.60 | $56.55|S 45240 | S 6799 | S 543.92
7 XXL $54.14 | S 37898 | S 50.00 | S 350.00 (S 5756 (S 40292 [ S 50.00 | S 350.00 | $65.20 S 456.40 | $58.55|S 409.85 | S 67.99 | S 475.93
1 XXXL $60.14 | S 60.14 | S 55.00 | S 55.00 [ S 63.80 S 63.80 | S 56.00 | S 56.00 | $73.30 | S 73.30 [ $59.55 | S 59.55 S 75.99 | S 75.99
PR-16 8 M-XL $1251 (S 100.08 | S 13.00 | S 104.00 | S 23.32 | S 186.56 | S 16.00 |S 128.00 ($22.70|S 181.60 | $ 14.54 | S 116.32 | S 19.99 | S 159.92
7 XXL $14.54 | S 101.78 | $ 15.00 | S 105.00 | $ 25.27 | S 176.89 [ $ 20.00 | S 140.00 | $25.00 | S 175.00 | $16.54 | S 115.78 | $ 24.82 | S 173.74
1 XXXL $15.82 (S 1582 (S 16.50 | S 16.50 | S 27.46 | S 27.46 | S 22.00 | S 22.00 | $26.60 | S 26.60 | $17.54 | S 1754 | S 2749 | S 27.49
PR-17 4 M-XL $40.67 | S 162.68 | $ 90.00 | S  360.00 No Bid $ 70.00 | S 280.00 | No Bid $31.39 (S 12556 [ $ 99.99 | S  399.96

XXL $41.67 | S - $ 90.00 | $ - No Bid - $ 70.00 - No Bid $33.39|5S - $ 9999 |S -
PR-18 3 M-XL $40.67 | S 122.01 | $100.00 | S  300.00 No Bid §$ 70.00 | S 210.00 | No Bid $31.50 (S 94.50 [ S 99.99 | S 299.97




2021 T-Shirts and Uniforms Bid Results

COMPANY SP Manufacturing Great Armadillo NYS Indus for Dis IPI, Inc. G&G Int'l Express Ink E Customs
ITEM Qry SIZE
XXL $41.67 | S = $100.00 | S = No Bid - $ 70.00 = No Bid $33.50 (S = $ 99.99 | S -
PR-19 6 M-XXL $35.75 S 21450 | S 3150 | S 189.00 | S 36.46 | S 21876 | S 36.00 | S 216.00 | $44.15|S 26490 |$3459 S 207.54 | S 39.99 | S 239.94
XXL $35.75 S 33.00|S = - $ 37.00 = $44.15|S - $36.59 | S = S 4099 | S -
PR-20 6 M-XL S 499 (S 2994 |S 7.00|S 42.00 | S 10.85 | S 65.10 | S 7.50 (S 45.00 | $22.45 (S 13470 (S 6.24|S 3744 |S 9.49 (S 56.94
XXL $ 599 |S = $ 10.00 | S = No Bid = $ 11.50 = $2245|S = S 824 |5 = S 1199 |S =
PR-21 6 M-XL S 499 (S 2994 |S 7.00|S 42.00 | S 10.85 | S 65.10 | S 7.50 (S 45.00 | $22.45 (S 13470 (S 6.24|S 3744 |S 9.49 (S 56.94
XXL $ 599 |S = S 850]|S = No Bid = $ 11.50 = $2245|S = S 824 |5 = $ 1199 |S =
H-1 115 S-XL S 284 (S 32660 | S 3.00|S 345.00 | $ 6.00 [ S 690.00 (S 4.00|S 460.00|S 590|S 67850 (S 336|S 386.40 [ S 4.25|S 488.75
8 XXL S 496 |S 39.68 | S 3.25|S 26.00 | S 8.48 | S 67.84 S 6.00|S 48.00 | S 8.45|S 67.60 [ S 5.36|S 4288 |S 6.79|S 54.32
10 XXXL S 5.02(S 50.20 |S 6.50 | S 65.00 | S 9.60 | S 96.00 | S 7.50 (S 75.00 | $11.20|S 112.00|S$ 636 |S 63.60 |S 7.99|S 79.90
H-2 115 S-XL S 553|S 63595 |S 550|S 63250|S 10.83|S 1,24545|S 6.00|S 690.00 S 9.80|S$ 1,127.00|S$ 6.07 |S 698.05|S 7.35|S  845.25
9 XXL S 7.22|S 64.98|S 7.50 (S 67.50 | S 13.29 | S 119.61 |S 8.00 (S 72.00 | $12.75|S 11475 |S$S 807 |S 7263 |S 9.75|S 87.75
10 XXXL S 761|5S 76.10 | S 10.25| S 10250 [ S 1498 | S 149.80 | $ 9.00 | S 90.00 [ $1490|S 149.00 |S$ 9.07 |S 90.70 | $ 10.75|S 107.50
H-3 65 M-XL $2865(S 1,862.25|S$ 28.00|S 1,820.00 | S 27.60 |S 1,794.00 | $ 30.00 [ S 1,950.00 | $33.90 | S 2,203.50 | $29.04 | S 1,887.60 | S 35.15 | S 2,284.75
10 XXL $32.08|S 320.80 | S 31.00|S 310.00|S 31.10|S 311.00 | S 33.00|S 330.00($37.70|S 377.00|S531.04 (S 31040 | S 39.25|S  392.50
11 XXXL $32.08 S 352.88 | S 31.00 | S 341.00 (S 3161 (S 347.71 | S 33.00 S 363.00|S$37.75|S 415.25($32.04|S 352.44 | S 39.85 | S 438.35
H-4 45 L-XL $39.06|S 1,757.70 |S$ 3750 |S 1,687.50 S 43.18 S 1,943.10 (S 38.00|S 1,710.00 | $44.70 |S 2,011.50 | $38.93 |S 1,751.85 | S 46.99 | S 2,114.55
12 XXL $39.06 | S 468.72 | S 3750 | S 450.00 | S 43.18|S 518.16 [ S 38.00 | S 456.00 | $44.70 |S 536.40 | $4093|S 491.16 | S 46.99 | S 563.88
13 XXXL $42.86 | S 557.18 | S 4050 |S 526,50 |S  46.56 | S 605.28 | S 41.00|S 533.00($49.20|S 639.60|S54193 (S 545.09 | S 49.99 |S  649.87
RR-1 11 S-XL S 3.46|S 38.06|S 6.00(S 66.00 | S 6.50 [ S 7150 |S 4.00 (S 44.00 | $1135(S 12485 (S 3.48|S 3828 |S 435|S 47.85
12 XXL S 5585 66.96 | S 8.25|S 99.00 | $ 898 |S 107.76 | $ 6.00 | S 72.00 [ $1395|S 167.40|S 548 |S 65.76 | S 6.85|S 82.20
13 XXL Tall S 937|S 121.81 | S 10.25|S 133.25 | S 12.04 | S 156.52 | S 7.00 | S 91.00 | $1395(S 18135|S 8.62|S 112.06 |S 8.50 (S 110.50
RR-2 5 S-XL S 6.15|S 30.75|S 6.45|S 3225 (S 1083 |S 54.15 S 6.00|S 30.00 | $12.80 | S 64.00 [ S 639 |S 3195 (S 4.59|S 22.95
10 XXL S 731(S 73.10|S 850 (S 85.00 | S 13.29 | S 13290 | S 8.00|S 80.00 | $1730 (S 173.00 (S 8.39|S 83.90|S 7.09|S 70.90
5 XXL Tall $10.20 | S 51.00 | $ 10.00 | S 50.00 [ $ 15.16 | S 75.80 (S 9.00|S 45.00 [ $17.30 | S 86.50 | $ 10.64 | S 5320 (S 8.49|S 42.45
RR-3 30 S-XL S 3.09(S 92.70 |S 450 (S 135.00 | S 550 | $ 165.00 |S 4.00|S 12000(S 790|S 237.00|S 3.62|S 108.60 | S 4.25|S 127.50
15 XXL $ 5.13|5S 7695 | S 6.50|S 97.50 | $ 8.06 | S 12090 |$ 5.25(S 78.75|$11.20|S 168.00|S 562 |S 8430 (S 7.99|S 119.85
XXXL S 553(S - S 750(S - S 899 |S - S 7.00|(S - $1335 (S - S 6.62|5S - S 849 (S -
RR-4 30 S-XL S 5615 16830 (S 7.00|S 210.00 | $ 935 (S 280.50 |S 6.00|S 180.00$10.75|S 32250|S 6.39 (S 191.70 | $ 6.75|S 202.50
15 XXL S 686 (S 102.90 | S 9.00 | S 135.00 | S 10.70 | S 160.50 |S 8.00|S 120.00(S$1220|S 183.00|S 839 (S 12585 |S 9.75|S 146.25
XXXL S 7.09|S = $ 11.00 | S = S 1086 |S = $ 10.00 | S - $13.25|S - $ 939]|5S = $ 10.00 | S -
BM-1 30 S-XL S 3.09(S 92.70 |S 4.25|S 127.50 | S 550 | $ 165.00 |S 4.00|S 12000(S 9.25|S 277.50|S 336 (S 100.80 | S 4.19|S 125.70
5 XXL $ 5.13|S 2565 (S 7.25(S 36.25 | S 8.06 | S 4030 | S 6.50 (S 32.50 [ $11.70 | S 58.50 [ $ 5.36|S 2680 S 7.09 (S 35.45
BM-2 30 S-XL S 561(S 168.30 | S 7.00 | S 210.00 | $ 10.83 | S 32490 (S 5.00(|$S 150.00|S$1150|S 345.00($ 6.07|S 182.10 | S 7.00 | S 210.00
5 XXL S 6.86|S 3430 (S 9.00|S 45.00 | S 13.29|S 66.45 S 7.00|S 35.00 | $13.45|S 67.25 S 807 |S 40.35 | S 10.00 | S 50.00
BM-3 30 S-XL S 574 |S 17220 |S 7.00 | S 210.00 | $ 9.18 | S 27540 (S 7.00S 210.00|S16.25|S 48750 (S 630|S 189.00 | S 11.50 | S 345.00
5 XXL S 7.19|5S 3595 (S 9.00|S 45.00 | S 11.79 | S 58.95 S 9.00|S 45.00 | $16.25 | S 81.25 (S 830|S 4150 | S 13.75|S 68.75
BM-4 3 L-XL $3876 S 116.28 | S 37.50 | S 112.50 | S 43.18 | S 129.54 |$ 39.00|S 117.00 [ $54.55|S 163.65|5$3893 (S 116.79 | S 46.88 | S 140.64
1 XXL $38.76 | S 38.76 | S 37.50 | S 3750 | S 43.18 | S 43.18 | S 39.00 | S 39.00 | $54.55 | S 54.55 [ $40.93 | S 40.93 | S 46.88 | S 46.88
B-1 1 S-XL $17.14 | S 17.14 | S 1450 | S 14.50 | S 19.52 | S 19.52 [ S 16.00 | S 16.00 | $29.60 | S 29.60 | $15.52 | S 1552 [ S 18.00 | S 18.00
1 XXL $18.36 | S 1836 | S 1550 (S 1550 | S 20.56 | S 20.56 | $ 17.00 | S 17.00 | $30.90 | $ 30.90 | $17.52 | S 1752 |$ 1950 | S 19.50




2021 T-Shirts and Uniforms Bid Results

COMPANY SP Manufacturing Great Armadillo NYS Indus for Dis IPI, Inc. G&G Int'l Express Ink E Customs
ITEM Qry SIZE
B-2 1 S-XL $ 9.12|5S 912 |$ 650 (S 6.50 | S 13.83|S 13.83|S 7.00 (S 7.00 | $21.95|S 2195 (S 815|5S 815|S 7.00 (S 7.00
1 XXL $10.48 | S 1048 | S 8.00 S 8.00 | S 16.29 | S 16.29 [ S 9.00 | S 9.00 [ $23.95|S 23.95|5$10.15 (S 10.15 [ S 10.00 | S 10.00
B-3 1 S-XL S 6515 6.51|S 7.00 (S 7.00 | S 850 | S 850 |S$ 6.00 (S 6.00 | $23.05 | S 2305 (S 6.85|5S 6.85|S 7.89 (S 7.89
1 XXL S 799 (S 799 (S 9.00|S 9.00 | S 1156 | S 1156 [ S 8.00|S 8.00 | $24.60 | S 2460 |S 885 (S 885 |5 10.89 | S 10.89
B-4 1 L No Bid $250.00 | S 250.00 | S 354.52|S 354.52 | $120.00 | S 120.00 | No Bid No Bid $250.00 | $ 250.00
B-5 1 XXL No Bid S 46.00 | S 46.00 [ S 99.85|S 99.85|S$ 40.00 | S 40.00 | No Bid No Bid $250.00 | $ 250.00
PL-1 2 M-XL (Men) |$31.31 S 62.62 | S 15.00 | S 30,00 (S 31.25(S 62.50 | S 24.00 | S 48.00 | $41.65|S 83.30 [ $17.79 | S 35.58 | S 33.00 | S 66.00
M-L(Ladies) |[$31.31 (S - S 15.00 | $ - S 3125(S - S 24.00 (S - $41.65|S - $17.79 | S - S 33.00 (S -
PL-2 2 L-XL $17.14 | S 3428 | S 15.00 | S 30.00 (S 1952 S 39.04 | S 16.00 | S 32.00 [ $29.15| S 58.30 [ $15.52 | S 31.04 | S 18.75|S 37.50
PL-3 2 M-XL $2692 (S 53.84 | S 23.00 | S 46.00 | S 29.74 | S 59.48 | S 24.00 | S 48.00 | $ 40.05 | S 80.10 | $25.52 | S 51.04 | $ 31.00 | S 62.00
PL-4 2 M-XL $11.48 | S 2296 S 9.75|S 19.50 | $ 9.18 | S 1836 |S 9.00 | S 18.00 | $23.65 | S 4730 | S 7.44|S 1488 |S 9.50 (S 19.00
PL-5 2 M-XL $36.57 S 73.14 |$S 31.00 | S 62.00 | S 38.43|5S 76.86 | S 34.00 | S 68.00 | $52.90 |S 105.80 | $34.26 | S 68.52 | S 41.00 | S 82.00
PL-6 4 XS-XL $34.23|S 136.92 | $ 29.50 | S 118.00 [ S 38.75|S 155.00 [ $ 34.00 | S 136.00|S$46.65|S 186.60 | $33.10 | S 13240 | $ 39.50 | S 158.00
S-1 1 M-XL $17.14 | S 17.14 | S 1475 | S 14.75 | S 19.52 | S 19.52 [ S 16.00 | S 16.00 | $29.15 | S 29.15|$ 1552 | S 1552 [ S 1875 |S 18.75
1 XXL $18.36 | S 1836 | S 1575 S 15.75|S 2056 | S 20.56 | $ 17.00 | S 17.00 | $29.15 | $ 29.15 [ $17.52 | S 17.52 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00
1 XXXL $19.57 | S 19.57 | S 16.75 | S 16.75 | S 20.56 | S 20.56 | S 18.00 | S 18.00 | $32.15 | S 32.15|$1852 S 1852 [ S 2150 | S 21.50
S-2 10 S-XL $ 331]|5S 33.10 (S 5.00|S 50.00 | $ 6.00 | S 60.00 | S 4.00|S 40.00 | $17.85|S 17850 |S$ 3.36|S 3360 (S 430|S 43.00
1 XXL S 543 (S 543 (S 7.25|S 7.25 | S 8.48 | S 848 |S 6.50|S 6.50 [ $21.65| S 2165|S 536 (S 536 (S 730|S 7.30
1 XXXL S 549 |S 549 |S 825|S 825 |S 9.60 | S 960 S 7.00 (S 7.00 | $22.90 | S 2290 (S 6365 636 |S 830 (S 8.30
S-3 6 M-XL S 6.00(S 36.00 | S 6.75|S 40.50 | S 10.83 | S 64.98|S 6.00|S 36.00 | $23.75|S 14250 (S 6.07|S 3642 |S 7.25|S 43.50
1 XXL S 7.16|S 7.16 |S 9.00 S 9.00 |$ 1329 (S 13.29|$S 8.00 (S 8.00 | $26.40|S 2640 | S 8.07|S 8.07 | $ 10.00 | S 10.00
1 XXXL S 753 (S 753 S 11.00|S 11.00 | S 1498 | S 1498 [ S 10.00 | S 10.00 | $ 27.55 | S 27.55|S 9.07 |S 9.07 | S 11.00 | S 11.00
S-4 1 M-XL $32.90 | S 32.90 [ $ 30.00 | S 30.00 (S 30.60 S 30.60 | S 31.00 | S 31.00 [ $48.90 | S 48.90 [ $31.80 | S 31.80 | S 38.25|S 38.25
1 XXL $36.33 (S 36.33|S$ 33.00 (S 33.00 | S 34.10]|5S 34.10 | $ 34.00 | S 34.00 | $51.45 (S 51.45|$33.80 (S 33.80 | $ 4150 | S 41.50
1 XXXL $36.33|S 36.33 | S 34.00 | S 3400 (S 3461|S 34.61 | S 34.00 | S 34.00 [ $51.50 | S 51.50 | $34.80 | S 34.80 | S 41.50 | S 41.50
1 XXXXL $36.33 (S 36.33 | No Bid No Bid S 34.00 (S 34.00 | $53.95 (S 53.95|$35.80 | S 35.80 | S 41.50 | S 41.50
S-5 6 M-XL $39.06 | S 23436 | S 3850 |S 231.00|S 43.18|S 259.08 | S 38.00|S 228.00 |$56.45|S 338.70| 53893 (S 233.58 | S 4830 (S 289.80
4 XXL $39.06 | S 156.24 | S 38.50 | S 154.00 | S 43.18|S 172.72 |$ 38.00 S 152.00 [ $56.45|S 225.80|S$4093 (S 163.72 | S 48.30 | S 193.20
1 XXXL $42.86 | S 42.86 | S 41.25|S 41.25|S 46.56 | S 46.56 | S 41.00 | S 41.00 | $60.50 | S 60.50 | $41.93 | S 4193 | S 5230 |S 52.30
1 XXXXL $42.86 | S 42.86 | S 41.25|S 41.25|S 4656 | S 46.56 | S 41.00 | S 41.00 | $60.50 | S 60.50 | $42.93 | S 4293 | S 5230 (S 52.30
W-1 15 S-XL $14.01|S 210.15|S 1420 |S 213.00|S 1756 |S 263.40 | S 15.00|S 225.00 | $2150|S 322,50 (51390 (S 208.50 | S 17.50 | S 262.50
5 XXL $16.43 | S 82.15|S$ 17.20 | S 86.00 | S 19.64 | S 98.20 | $ 17.00 | S 85.00 | $24.00 (S 120.00 | $14.90 | S 7450 | S 1875 | S 93.75
5 XXXL $17.65|S 88.25 | S 18.20 | S 91.00 [ S 20.68 | S 103.40 | $ 18.00 | S 90.00 | $25.25|S 126.25|$15.90 | S 79.50 [ S 19.75|S 98.75
W-2 80 S-XL S 291(S 23280 (S 450(S 360.00 | S 6.00 [ S 480.00 (S 4.00|S 320.00|S$ 590(S 47200 (S 3.36|S 26880 (S 4.15|S 332.00
10 XXL S 5.03]|S 5030 [ S 6.50|S 65.00 | $ 8.48 | S 8480 (S 6.50|S 65.00 [ S 8.45|S 8450 [ S 5.36|S 53.60 | S 6.65|S 66.50
10 XXL S 5.09(S 5090 |$ 7.50 (S 75.00 | S 9.60 | S 96.00 | S 8.00|S 80.00 | $11.25 (S 11250 (S 6.36 (S 63.60 | S 8.00|S 80.00
W-3 80 S-XL S 5.60|S 44800 |S 750|S 600.00|S 10.83|S 866.40 |S 7.00|S 560.00 (S 860|S 688.00(S$S 6.07|S 48560 |S 7.60 S  608.00
10 XXL S 676 |S 67.60 | S 10.00 | S 100.00 | S 13.29 | S 13290 | S 9.00 | S 90.00 | $1090 (S 109.00 | S 8.07 | S 80.70 | $ 10.50 | S 105.00
10 XXXL S 7.13|S 7130 | S 12.25|S 122.50 | $ 1498 | S 149.80 [ $ 11.00 | S 110.00|S 1240 (S 12400 (S 9.07|S 90.70 | $ 11.50 | S 115.00
w-4 17 M-XL $10.51 (S 178.67 | S 12.75| S 216.75 | S 16.51 | S 280.67 [ S 13.00 [ S 221.00|S$12.80|S 21760 |S$1254 S 213.18 (S 930S 158.10
2 XXL $11.68 | S 2336 |$ 1350 (S 27.00 | $ 1755 (S 35.10 [ S 14.00 | S 28.00 | $14.05|S 28.10 [ $14.54 | S 29.08 | $ 10.00 | S 20.00
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COMPANY SP Manufacturing Great Armadillo NYS Indus for Dis IPI, Inc. G&G Int'l Express Ink E Customs
ITEM Qry SIZE
2 XXXL $14.02 | S 28.04 | $ 1550 (S 31.00 (S 19.63|S 39.26 | S 14.00 | S 28.00 [ $16.55 | S 33.10 [ $15.54 | S 31.08 | S 11.00 | S 22.00
W-5 22 M-XL $38.66 S 850.52 | S 36.00 | S 792.00 (S 43.18 (S 94996 | S 39.00|S 858.00|$55.70 (S 1,225.40(S538.95|S 856.90 | S 48.25|S 1,061.50
5 XXL $38.66 | S 193.30 | $ 36.00 | S 180.00 [ S 43.18 | S 21590 | S 39.00|S 195.00 | $55.70 |S 278.50 | $40.95 | S 204.75 | S 48.25|S 241.25
4 XXXL $42.46 | S 169.84 | S 37.25| S 149.00 | S 46.56 | S 186.24 | S 42.00|S 168.00 [ $59.80 |S 239.20|S$4195|S 167.80 | S 52.25| S 209.00
W-6 3 M-XL $57.55|S 172.65 [ $135.00 | S 405.00 [ S 46.77 | S 14031 (S 70.00 | S 210.00 | $66.90 | S 200.70 | $47.32|S 14196 | $ 59.00 | S 177.00
1 XXL $5755 (S 57.55 | $140.00 | S 140.00 | S 46.77 | S 46.77 | S 70.00 | S 70.00 | $66.90 | S 66.90 | $49.32 | S 4932 | S 61.00 | S 61.00
1 XXL $57.55|S 57.55 | $140.00 | S 140.00 [ S 46.77 | S 46.77 | S 70.00 | S 70.00 | $ 68.75 | S 68.75 | $50.32 | S 50.32 | $ 65.00 | S 65.00
wW-7 22 M-XL $3190 (S 701.80 | S 30.00 | S 660.00 [S 30.60 | S 673.20 [ S 31.00 S 682.00|S$3560|S 783.20 (53180 (S 699.60 | S 35.00 | S 770.00
5 XXL $3533|S 176.65 | $ 31.00 | S 155.00 [ $ 3410 (S 170.50 [ $ 34.00 | S 170.00|$39.40 S 197.00 | $33.80|S 169.00 | $ 39.00 | S 195.00
2 XXXL $3533 (S 70.66 | S 32.00 | S 64.00 | S 34615 69.22 | S 34.00 | S 68.00 | $39.45 | S 78.90 | $34.80 | S 69.60 | S 39.00 | S 78.00
W-8 17 S-XL $53.14 | S 903.38 |S 48.00|S 816.00|S 57.56|S 978.52 | S 55.00 | S 935.00 {$5835|S 99195 |$56.55 (S 961.35|S 6890 |S 1,171.30
4 XXL $53.14 | S 212.56 | S 48.00 | S 192.00 |S 57.56|S 230.24 | S 55.00 [ S 220.00 |$5835|S 233.40|$5855 (S 23420 (S 6890 | S 275.60
4 XXXL $60.16 | S 24064 | S 5400 |S 216.00|S 63.80|S 255.20 | S 60.00 | S 240.00 | $65.60 |S 262.40 | $59.55 S 23820 | S 76.50 | S  306.00
NUT-1 6 S-XL $55.14 | S 330.84 | S 48.00 | S 288.00 (S 5756 (S 34536 | S 55.00 [ S 330.00|S$61.25|S 367.50|$56.55 (S 339.30 (S 69.50 | S 417.00
NUT-2 6 S-XL $29.55|S 17730 | $ 25.00 | S 150.00 [ $ 29.74 | S 178.44 | S 25.00 | S 150.00 | $33.95|S 203.70 [ $27.11|S 162.66 | S 33.75 | S 202.50
LIB-1 5 LG S 3.46|S 1730 (S 6.00 S 30.00 | S 6.00 [ S 30.00|$S 4.00(S 20.00 | $12.20 | S 61.00 | S 336 (S 16.80 (S 399 |S 19.95
LIB-2 5 LG S 6.15|S 30.75|S 7.00|S 35.00 (S 10.83|S 5415 (S 7.00|S 35.00 [ $18.30 | S 91.50 | $ 6.07 | S 3035 (S 7.10|S 35.50
LIB-3 1 LG $1251 (S 1251 (S 1528 | S 1528 | S 20.15 | S 20.15 | S 15.00 | S 15.00 | $56.00 | S 56.00 | $ 14.54 | S 14.54 | S 19.00 | S 19.00
PD-1 5 LG S 3465 1730 |S 6.00 S 30.00 | $ 6.00 | S 30.00 (S 4.00|S 20.00 | $17.25|S 86.25 S 3.36|S 16.80 |S 4.00 S 20.00
5 XXL S 5.58(S 2790 | S 8.00|S 40.00 | S 8.48 | S 4240 S 650 (S 32.50 | $19.80 | S 99.00 |$ 5.36|S 26.80 | S 7.00|S 35.00
PD-2 2 LG S 6.15|S 1230 | $ 28.00 | S 56.00 [ S 27.60 | S 55.20 [ $ 31.00 | S 62.00 | $47.95|S 95.90 | $29.04 | S 58.08 | S 34.80 | S 69.60
2 XXL S 731(S 1462 | S 31.00 | S 62.00 | S 31.10|S 62.20 | S 34.00 | S 68.00 | $51.70 | S 103.40 | $31.04 |S 62.08 | S 38.80 | S 77.60
PD-3 2 LG $44.01|S 88.02 | S 38.00 | S 76.00 [ S 46.18 | S 92.36 | S 39.00 | S 78.00 | $57.70 | S 11540 |S41.68 |S 83.36 | S 53.97 | S 107.94
PD-4 2 XXL $55.14 | S 110.28 | S 52.00 | S 104.00 | S 57.56|S 115.12 |$ 60.00|S 120.00 [ $69.60 | S 139.20 | $58.55 (S 117.10 | S 68.00 | S 136.00
TOTAL SUM S 23,974.76 S 26,177.14 S 33,794.63 $27,227.85 $ 36,524.30 S 25,747.63 S 31,483.58




COMPANY All American Restoration
ITEM Qry SIZE
PR-1 44 S-XL S 1019 |S 44836 |S 1850 |S 814.00
4 XXL S 1150 (S 46.00 | S 1950 | S 78.00
PR-2 6 M-XL No Bid $ 1850 |S 111.00
PR-3 242 S-XL S 548(S$1,326.16 | S 10.12 | S 2,449.04
4 XXL S 863|S 3452 (S 1112 |S 44.48
PR-4 130 S-XL S 360|S 468.00|S$ 10.12|S 1,315.60
2 XXL S 7.60|S 15.20 | $ 10.12|S 20.24
456 YS-YL S 3.74|S$1,705.44 | S 10.12 | S 4,614.72
48 YXS S 374|S 17952 |S 10.12|S 485.76
PR-5 126 S-XL S 415|$S 52290 (S 10.12|S 1,275.12
6 XXL S 740(S 4440 | S 10.12 | S 60.72
24 YXS-YL S 429|S$S 10296 S 10.12|S 242.88
PR-6 12 S-XL No Bid $ 1012 |S 121.44
YXS No Bid S 1012 |5S -
20 YS-YL No Bid $ 10.12|S 202.40
PR-7 45 S-XL S 432|S$S 19440 (S 10.12|S 45540
15 XXL S 756|S 11340(S 10.12|S$S 151.80
PR-8 70 S-XL No Bid $ 10.12|S 708.40
14 XXL No Bid $ 10.12|S 141.68
PR-9 62 S-XL S 542|S 336.04|S 1214 |S 752.68
4 XXL S 910(S 3640 | S 12.14|S 48.56
PR-10 108 M-XL S 6.11|S 659.88 (S 11.19|S 1,208.52
PR-11 114 S-XL No Bid S 17.90 | S 2,040.60
6 XXL No Bid S 1790 |S 107.40
60 YS-YL No Bid $ 17.90 | S 1,074.00
PR-12
PR-13 6 M-XL (Men) No Bid $ 1850 |S 111.00
0 M-XL (Ladies)| No Bid $ 1850 (S -
5 XXL (Ladies) No Bid S 1850 (S  92.50
PR-14 6 M-XL No Bid No Bid
6 XXL No Bid No Bid
1 XXXL No Bid No Bid
PR-15 8 M-XL No Bid No Bid
7 XXL No Bid No Bid
1 XXXL No Bid No Bid
PR-16 8 M-XL S 2182 |S 17456 S 2890 |S 231.20
7 XXL S 28.67|S 200.69 S 2890 |S 202.30
1 XXXL S 2999 (S 29.99 | S 2890 (S 28.90
PR-17 4 M-XL No Bid No Bid
XXL No Bid No Bid
PR-18 3 M-XL No Bid No Bid
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COMPANY All American Restoration
ITEM Qry SIZE
XXL No Bid No Bid
PR-19 6 M-XXL No Bid No Bid
XXL No Bid No Bid
PR-20 6 M-XL No Bid S 1012 |S 60.72
XXL No Bid S 1112 |S =
PR-21 6 M-XL No Bid S 1012 |S 60.72
XXL No Bid S 1112 |S =
H-1 115 S-XL S 415|$S 477.25|S$ 10.12|S 1,163.80
8 XXL S 9.06|S 7248 | S 1112 |S 88.96
10 XXXL S 964|S 96.40 | S 12.12 | S 121.20
H-2 115 S-XL S 717 |S 82455 (S 12.14|S 1,396.10
9 XXL S 986|S 88.74 | S 13.14 | S 118.26
10 XXXL $ 1210 (S 121.00 (S 14.14|S 141.40
H-3 65 M-XL No Bid S 17.85|S 1,160.25
10 XXL No Bid $ 18.85|S 188.50
11 XXXL No Bid $ 19.85|S 218.35
H-4 45 L-XL No Bid No Bid
12 XXL No Bid No Bid
13 XXXL No Bid No Bid
RR-1 11 S-XL S 561(S 61.71|$ 10.12 | S 111.32
12 XXL S 89 |S 107.52|S 11.12|S 133.44
13 XXL Tall S 1120 S 14560 (S 1212 |S 157.56
RR-2 5 S-XL $ 555(S 27.75 | S 1214 (S 60.70
10 XXL S 889|S 88.90 |$ 13.14 | S 131.40
5 XXL Tall S 1114 |S 55.70 [ S 14.14 | S 70.70
RR-3 30 S-XL S 493 |S 14790 (S 10.12|S 303.60
15 XXL S 813 |S 12195|S 11.12|S 166.80
XXXL S 1113 (S - S 1212|S -
RR-4 30 S-XL S 793|S 23790 (S 12.14|S 364.20
15 XXL S 1093 |$S 16395|S 13.14|S 197.10
XXXL S 1310 (S = S 14.14|S =
BM-1 30 S-XL S 569(|$ 17070 |$ 10.12|S 303.60
5 XXL S 858]|S 4290 | S 11.12 (S 55.60
BM-2 30 S-XL S 855(|S 256,50 (S 12.14|S 364.20
5 XXL S 1124 S 56.20 [ S 13.14 | S 65.70
BM-3 30 S-XL No Bid $ 1850 |S 555.00
5 XXL No Bid $ 1950 (S 97.50
BM-4 3 L-XL No Bid No Bid
1 XXL No Bid No Bid
B-1 1 S-XL No Bid S 1850 |5S 18.50
1 XXL No Bid $ 1950 (S 19.50
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COMPANY All American Restoration
ITEM Qry SIZE
B-2 1 S-XL No Bid S 12.14|5S 12.14
1 XXL No Bid S 13.14|5S 13.14
B-3 1 S-XL No Bid $ 1012 |S 10.12
1 XXL No Bid S 1012 |5S 10.12
B-4 1 L No Bid No Bid
B-5 1 XXL No Bid No Bid
PL-1 2 M-XL (Men) | No Bid No Bid
M-L(Ladies) No Bid No Bid
PL-2 2 L-XL No Bid $ 1850 (S 37.00
PL-3 2 M-XL No Bid S 1850 |5S 37.00
PL-4 2 M-XL No Bid $ 1850 (S 37.00
PL-5 2 M-XL No Bid No Bid
PL-6 4 XS-XL No Bid No Bid
S-1 1 M-XL No Bid S 1850 |5S 18.50
1 XXL No Bid $ 1950 (S 19.50
1 XXXL No Bid S 20.50|S 20.50
S-2 10 S-XL No Bid $ 10.12|S 101.20
1 XXL No Bid S 1112 |5S 11.12
1 XXXL No Bid S 13.12|S 13.12
S-3 6 M-XL No Bid S 1214 |5S 72.84
1 XXL No Bid S 13.14|S 13.14
1 XXXL No Bid S 1414 |5S 14.14
S-4 1 M-XL No Bid $ 17.85|5S 17.85
1 XXL No Bid S 18.85|5S 18.85
1 XXXL No Bid $ 19.85|5S 19.85
1 XXXXL No Bid S 20.85 (S 20.85
S-5 6 M-XL No Bid No Bid
4 XXL No Bid No Bid
1 XXXL No Bid No Bid
1 XXXXL No Bid No Bid
W-1 15 S-XL $ 1837 |S 27555|S 1850 |S 277.50
5 XXL $ 21.01|$S 105.05(S 18.50|S 92.50
5 XXXL $ 2233 (S 11165|S 1850 (S 92.50
W-2 80 S-XL S 423|S 33840(|S$ 10.12|S 809.60
10 XXL S 914 |S 9140 (S 11.12|S 111.20
10 XXL S 972|S 97.20 | $ 1212 |S 121.20
W-3 80 S-XL S 724|S 57920 S 12.14|S 971.20
10 XXL S 994 (S 99.40 | $ 13.14 | S 131.40
10 XXXL $ 1218 (S 12180 (S 14.14|S 141.40
w-4 17 M-XL $ 1056 |$S 179.52 | No Bid
2 XXL S 1256 |S 25.12 | No Bid
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COMPANY All American Restoration
ITEM Qry SIZE
2 XXXL S 1456 | S 29.12 | No Bid
W-5 22 M-XL No Bid No Bid
5 XXL No Bid No Bid
4 XXXL No Bid No Bid
W-6 3 M-XL No Bid No Bid
1 XXL No Bid No Bid
1 XXL No Bid No Bid
wW-7 22 M-XL No Bid S 17.85|S 392.70
5 XXL No Bid S$ 1885|S 94.25
2 XXXL No Bid S 19.85 (S 39.70
W-8 17 S-XL No Bid No Bid
4 XXL No Bid No Bid
4 XXXL No Bid No Bid
NUT-1 6 S-XL No Bid No Bid
NUT-2 6 S-XL No Bid $ 1850 |S 111.00
LIB-1 5 LG No Bid S 1012 |5S 50.60
LIB-2 5 LG No Bid S 1214 |5S 60.70
LIB-3 1 LG No Bid S 30.00 (S 30.00
PD-1 5 LG No Bid $ 1012 |S 50.60
5 XXL No Bid S 1112 |S 55.60
PD-2 2 LG No Bid $ 17.85|5S 35.70
2 XXL No Bid S 18.85 (S 37.70
PD-3 2 LG No Bid No Bid
PD-4 2 XXL No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM N/A N/A
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